
Junior Mechanical Engineer (Norfolk, VA) 

Abbott On Call is looking for intelligent, driven, and energetic engineers for open positions in 
Norfolk, VA. Our Systems Engineering firm is a leader in engineering, modular ship design, 
development, test and validation, and interface verification and validation.  
 

Applicants must have the following: 
- Bachelor’s level degree in Mechanical Engineering 

 
Mechanical engineers research, develop, design, manufacture, and test tools, engines, machines, 
and other mechanical devices. They work on power-producing machines such as electric 
generators, internal combustion engines, and steam and gas turbines. They also develop power-
using machines such as refrigeration and air-conditioning equipment, machine tools, material 
handling systems, elevators and escalators, industrial production equipment, and robots used in 
manufacturing. 
 
Mechanical engineers also design tools that other engineers need for their work. Mechanical 
engineers rely on computers to assist them in efficiently performing computations, and by 
permitting the modeling and simulation of new designs as well as facilitating changes to existing 
designs. Computer-Aided Design (CAD) and Computer-Aided Manufacturing (CAM) are used 
for design data processing and for turning the design into a product.  
 
Abbott On Call is proud to offer highly competitive salaries, a flexible work environment, and 
invaluable firsthand experience delivering mission-critical solutions for our customers. Our 
employees are our greatest asset, and our competitive benefit options are designed to support and 
protect our employees and their families. We offer robust Medical, Prescription, Dental, and 
Vision coverage, Life, Short-Term, and Long-Term Disability Insurance. We enable you to shape 
your financial future with a self-directed 401(k) and Tuition Reimbursement program. We promote 
a healthy work-life balance with flexible scheduling and PTO program.  Apply to join our team 
and work alongside peers with unmatched expertise in a workplace environment that fosters 
learning and growth. 
 
Please submit your application to resumes@aocinc.net.  
 

 


